BRIGHTON & HOVE CITY COUNCIL
ROAD TRAFFIC REGULATION ACT 1984

BRIGHTON & HOVE VARIOUS CONTROLLED PARKING ZONES
CONSOLIDATION ORDER 2008 AMENDMENT ORDER No.4 2012

Brighton & Hove City Council in exercise of its powers under Sections |, 2, 3, 4, 19, 32,
35, 35A, 43, 44, 45, 46, 46A, 47, 49, 51, 53, 55, 61, 63, 63A, 66, 117 and 124 (1) (c) & (d)
of the Road Traffic Regulation Act 1984 (“the 1984 Act”) as amended and Part 6 of the
Traffic Management Act 2004 and of all other enabling powers after consultation with the
Chief Officer of Police in accordance with Part lll of Schedule 9 to the 1984 Act hereby
makes the above named Order.

The provisions of this Order will come into operation on the ISt day of M\ 2012
and amend the Brighton & Hove Various Controlled Parking Zones Consolidation Order
2008 as amended as follows:

ARTICLE AMENDMENTS:

PART 10 - INDEX OF SCHEDULE |

Part 7 No Loading/Unloading
After existing Part 2.15 add new Parts to the Index as follows:
| 2.16 | Monday to Sunday 7am -10am & 4pm-7pm | M&Y |

SCHEDULE | AMENDMENTS:

Controlled Parking Zone A
Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Delete item 2a: Compton Road, Brighton (outside No.5}

Controlled Parking Zone C
Part |.1 No Waiting At Any Time
Delete and reinstate item 42: Leicester Street, Brighton

Part 7.1 Doctors Parking At Any Time
Delete item 2: St James’s Avenue, Brighton

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time

Add new item 35a: Royal Crescent — North side — From a point 5.6 metres east of the
western property boundary of No.6 Royal Crescent eastwards for a distance of 6.6
metres (outside No.7)

Amend item 37 Somerset Street: delete “15.9 metres and substitute “32.8 metres”

Part 12.11 Loading Only Monday to Sunday 9am to 6pm
Delete item 6a: Somerset Street, Brighton

Part 18.1 Streets eligible for a Resident’s Permits

Amend item 45 Ivory Place: insert “Excluding Flats 25-49 Ebenezer Apartments No.24" in
column (3) Specific Properties and insert “Excluding Flats 25-49 Ebenezer Apartments
No.24 (Car Free)” in column (4) Comments



Controlled Parking Zone H

Part 4.1 Permit parking only from Monday to Sunday between 9am - 8pm
inclusive

Delete item 78: Arundel Road, Brighton

Amend item 87 Arundel Street: delete “4 metres” and substitute “10.6 metres” delete “23
metres’ and substitute | 6.4 metres”

Delete item |35a: Manor Paddock, Brighton

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Amend item 72a Manor Paddock: delete “5 metres” and substitute “% metres™

Part 12.6 Loading Only Monday to Saturday 9am to épm
Renumber existing item | St George’s Road as item 2

Renumber existing item 2 St George’s Road as item 3
Renumber existing item 3 Whitehawk Road as item 4

Add new item |: Arundel Road — West side — From a point 6.5 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Arundel Place, northwards for a distance of 10 metres

Controlled Parking Zone ]

Part 5.4 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Medium Term Pay and Display
parking (for a period of up to 4 hours, with no return within 4 hours) from
Monday to Sunday between 2am to 8pm inclusive

Add new item 45a: Warleigh Road — East side — From a point 5 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Ditchling Rise southwards for a distance of 9.3 metres

Part 5.7 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Long Term Pay & Display
parking (for a period of up to 11 hours) from Monday to Sunday between 9am
to 8pm inclusive

Amend item 22 Vere Road: delete “24 metres” and substitute “30.6 metres”

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Add new item 3a: Campbell Road — West side — From the southern property boundary of
No.4 Campbell Road northwards for a distance of 6.6 metres (outside No.4)

Delete item 20: Warleigh Road, Brighton (adjoining No.88 Ditchling Rise)

Part | 1.1 Motorcycle only at any time
Delete item 22: VVarleigh Road, Brighton

Add new item 22: Warleigh Road - East side — From a point 14.3 metres south of the
southern kerbline of Ditchling Rise southwards for a distance of 3 metres

Controlled Parking Zone M
After existing Part 2.14 insert new Part in the Schedule as follows:
Part 2.15 No Loading Monday to Sunday 7am -10am and 4pm-7pm




[tem | Street Side of . .
No. | Name Road Description CPZ
From the eastern kerbline of Holland Road
VVestern _
| North | eastwards to the western kerbline of M
Read
Lansdowne Street
From the eastern kerbline of Lansdowne Street
Western \
2 North | eastwards to the western kerbline of M
Road
| ansdowne Place
Western From the eastern kerbline of Lansdowne Place
3 North | eastwards to the western kerbline of Farm M
Road
Road
Western From the eastern kerbline of Farm Road
4 North | eastwards to the western kerbline of Brunswick M
Road
Place
From the eastern kerbline of Brunswick Place
VWestern ,
5 Road North | eastwards to the western kerbline of M
Cambridge Road
Western From the eastern kerbline of Cambridge Road
6 North | eastwards to the western kerbline of Brunswick M
Road
Road
Western From the eastern kerlbine of Brunswick Road
7 es North | eastwards to the western kerbline of Yorle M
Road
Road
Western From the eastern kerbline of York Road
8 North | eastwards to the western kkerbline of Norfolk M
Road Road

Part 5.4 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Medium Term Pay & Display
parking (for a period of up to 4 hours, no return within 4 hours) from Monday
to Sunday between 9am-8pm inclusive

Amend item 18 Lansdowne Road: delete “and a point 6 metres” and substitute “to a point
|0 metres” delete “Salisbury Road” and substitute “York Villas™

Add new item [8a: Lansdowne Road — North side — From a point |5 metres west of the
western kervline of Furze Hill to a point 31m east of the eastern kerbline of Somerhill
Road

Add new item |8b: Lansdowne Road — North side — From a point |15 metres west of the
western kerbline of Somerhill Road to a point 41 metres east of the eastern kerbline of
Holland Road

Add new item |8c: Lansdowne Road — North side — From a point |7 metres west of the
western kerbline of Palmeira Avenue to a point 6 metres east of the eastern kerbine of
Salisbury Road

Add new item [8d: Lansdowne Road — North side — From a point 0.8 metres west of the
western kerbline of York Villas westwards for a distance of 6.5 metres

Add new item |8e: Lansdowne Road — North side — From a point 32.7 metres west of the
western lcerbline of York Villas westwards for a distance of 45 metres



Add new item 18f: Lansdowne Road — North side — From a point 80.5 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Furze Hill eastwards for a distance of 48.5 metres

Controlled Parking Zone N
Part |.1 No Waiting At Any Time

Delete and reinstate item 66: St John’s Road, Hove

Part 1.4 No Waiting Monday to Saturday $am to 6pm

Amend item | St John’s Road, Hove: delete the whole description and substitute “From
the prolongation of the north flank wall of No.17 St John's Road southwards to a point
21.5 metres north of the southern boundary wall of Adelaide Mansions

Controlled Parking Zone O
Part 5.10 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Long Term Pay & Display

parking (for a period up to |11 hours) from Monday to Saturday between 9am
and Bpm inclusive
Amend item 27 Wilbury Avenue: delete “26.3 metres and substitute “15.3 metres”

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Add new item 18c: Cromwell Road — North side — From a point 19.5 metres east of the
eastern kerbline of Wilbury Villas eastwards for a distance of 6.6 metres (outside No.38)

Add new item 63b: The Drive — East side — From a point | metre north of the property
boundary between No.62 & No.64 The Drive northwards for a distance of 6.6 metres
(outside No.64)

Part 11.]1 Motorcycle only at any time
Delete and reinstate item 54: Wilbury Villas, Hove

Delete and reinstate item 55 Wilbury Villas, Hove

Part 14.] Ambulance Parking Bays At Any Time
Delete item 6: Wilbury Avenue, Hove

Controlled Parking Zone Q
Part 5.8 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff (School) Pay & Display parking

(For a period of up to [ 1 hours) from Monday to Sunday between 9am to 8pm
inclusive

Delete, reinstate and amend item | Stanford Road: delete “36.5 metres northeast of the
northern kerbline of Hamilton Road” and substitute 1.5 metres south of the southern
boundary wall of No.61 Stanford Road”

Add new item 2: Stanford Road — East side — From a point 4 metres south of the southern
boundary wall of No.61 Stanford Road southwards to a point 36.5 metres north of the
northern kerbline of Hamilton Road

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Delete item 23a: Stanford Road, Brighton (outside No.7)



Controlled Parking Zone R
Part 5.4 Shared Permit Holders and Low Tariff Medium Term Pay & Display

parking (for a period of up to 4 hours, no return within 4 hours) from Monday
to Sunday between $am-8pm inclusive
Amend item 35a Portland Road: delete “eastwards for a distance of 21 metres”

Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Amend item 55a Pembroke Crescent: delete * 15 metres” and substitute “1 | metres”

Delete item 71: Rutland Road, Hove (outside No.53)

Controlled Parking Zone W
Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time

Delete item |: Berriedale Avenue, Hove (outside No.57)

Part [ 1.1 Motorcycle only at any time
Add new item ! la: Raphael Road — West side — From the northern property boundary of
No.20 Raphael Road southwards for a distance of 3 metres

Controlled Parking Zone Y
Part 1.4 No Waiting Monday to Saturday 9am to 6pm
Delete item 9: London Road, Brighton

Delete item |0: London Road, Brighton
Delete item 11: London Road, Brighton
Delete item |12: London Road, Brighton
Delete item |3: London Road, Brighton
Delete item {4: London Road, Brighton

Part 6.3 Exclusive Medium Tariff Short Term Pay & Display parking (for a
period of up to 2 hours no return within 4 hours) from Monday to Saturday
between 9am and é6pm inclusive

Amend item| 3 Gloucester Place: delete the whole description and substitute “From a
point 27.2 metres north of the southern property boundary of nos. 10 to |5 Gloucester
Place, northwards for a distance of {7 metres.

Part 6.5 Exclusive High Tariff Short Term Pay & Display parking (for a period
of up to 2 hours no return within 4 hours) from Monday to Saturday between
9am and épm inclusive

Delete item |: Gloucester Place, Brighton

Part 7.6 Doctors Parking Monday to Friday 7am to 8pm and Saturday 7am to
1Z2pm
Renumber existing item | Vernon Terrace as item 2

Add new item |: Clifton Road — West side — From the property boundary wall between
Nos. |14 & 15 Clifton Road northwards for a distance of 5.5 metres



Part 9.1 Disabled Badge Holders Parking At Any Time
Renumber existing item 50 Windlesham Road as item 51

Add new item 50: Windlesham Avenue ~ South side - From a point 5.3 metres west of the
eastern property boundary of Nos.3 to 5 Vernon Gardens westwards for a distance of
14.5 metres

Part 14.1 Ambulance Parking Bays At Any Time
Delete item 2: Windlesham Avenue, Brighton

Controlled Parking Zone Z
After existing Part 2.14 insert new Part in the Schedule as follows:
Part 2.15 No Loading Monday to Sunday 7am -10am and 4pm-7pm

Iltem | Street Side of . L.
No. | Name Road Description CPZ
Western From the eastern kerbline of Norfolk Road for
| North ] Z
Road a distance of 2.6 metres
Western From a point 22.1 metres east of the eastern
la er North | kerbline of Norfolk Road eastwards for a Z
Road .
distance of 13.5 metres
Western From the eastern kerbline of Borough Street
2 North . 4
Road for a distance of 12.5 metres
Western From a point 28.5 metres east of the eastern
2a North | kerbline of Borough Street eastwards for a Z
Road )
distance of 6 metres
Western From the eastern kerbline of Temple Street
3 North | eastwards to the western kerbline of Z
Road .
Montpelier Road

THE COMMON SEAL OF BRIGHTON & HOVE )
CITY COUNCIL was affixed hereto this 26™'day of )

Aol Two Thousand and Twelve. )
in the presence of

Authorised Person




